GOVERNMENT OF TAMIL NADU
2017

© [Regd. No. TN/CCN/467/2012-14.

[R. Dis. No. 197/2009.
[Price: Rs. 1.60 Paise.

TAMIL NADU
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY  pUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

CHENNAI, WEDNESDAY, JULY 12, 2017
Aani 28, Hevilambi, Thiruvalluvar Aandu—2048

Tamil Nadu
Act 27 of
1975.

Part IV—Section 1

Tamil Nadu Bills

BILL INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE
STATE OF TAMIL NADU

Under Rule 130 of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly Rules, the following Bill
which was introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu on
12th July, 2017 is published together with Statement of Objects and Reasons for
general information:—

L.A. Bill No. 35 of 2017.

A Bill further to amend the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration
Act, 1975.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in
the Sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration
(Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government
may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Schedule to the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975,-

(@) in item 1, for the words “Two thousand rupees”, the words
“Four thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) for item 2 and the entries relating thereto, the following item and
entries shall, respectively, be substituted, namely:-

“2. (1) For filing of any document during the first financial year of the
society.

(2) For filing of any document from the second financial year of the
society,-

Ex-IV-1-225(E)-1 [ 395 ]

Short title and
commence-
ment

Amendment of
Schedule.

Two hundred
rupees.



396

TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

(i) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year does not exceed One lakh rupees;

(i) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year exceeds one lakh rupees but does not exceed
five lakh rupees;

(iii) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year exceeds Five lakh rupees but does not exceeds
ten lakh rupees;

(iv) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year exceeds Ten lakh rupees but does not exceed
fifteen lakh rupees;

(v) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year exceeds fifteen lakh rupees but does not exceed
twenty lakh rupees;

(vi) when the annual receipt or expenditure of the society during
the preceding financial year exceeds Twenty lakh rupees;

(c) in item 3, for the words “Two hundred and Fifty rupees”, the words
“Four hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) in item 4, for the words “Two hundred and Fifty rupees”, the words
“Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted,;

(e) in item 5, for the words “Ten rupees per page”, the words
“Twenty rupees per page” shall be substituted;

(fy in tem 6, for the words “One hundred rupees” the words
“Two hundred rupees shall be substituted;

(g) in item 7, for the words “One thousand rupees”, the words
“Two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

One hundred
rupees.

Two hundred
rupees.

Three
hundred
rupees.

Four hundred
rupees.

Five hundred
rupees.

Six hundred
rupees.”;



TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 397

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS.

The Table of fees under the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975
(Tamil Nadu Act, 27 of 1975) was earlier revised in October, 2011. In as
much as more than five years have lapsed since the fees were last revised
and as the fees collected now are not commensurate with the services
rendered by the Registration Department, the Government have decided to
revise the fees payable to the Registrar and to amend the Schedule to the
Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975 (Tamil Nadu Act, 27 of 1975)
for the purpose.

2. The Bills seeks to give effect to the above decision.

K.C. VEERAMANI,
Minister for Commercial Taxes.

K. BOOPATHY,
Secretary (In-charge).

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE DIRECTOR OF STATIONERY AND PRINTING, CHENNAI
ON BEHALF OF THE GOVERNMENT OF TAMIL NADU



